
8 Days Cairo, Aswan,
Luxor & Felucca
Embark on an unforgettable eco-friendly journey through
Egypt on a traditional Nile sailing boat called a Felucca.
Discover the rich heritage, natural marvels, and ancient
culture of Egypt as you cruise down the Nile River. This
exceptional tour takes you to some of the most iconic
landmarks in Egypt, including the Sphinx and Giza Pyramids,
as well as the stunning temples of Luxor and Aswan.



Experience the unique Nubian culture, known for its
exceptional heritage and hospitality, during your voyage. The
Felucca sets sail from the Nubian village towards Kom Ombo
and Luxor Temple, where you will spend two days cruising
along the verdant green banks of the Nile, relaxing on the
deck furnished with comfortable mattresses, and enjoying
the awe-inspiring scenery.

Luxor, the ultimate destination, is where you will explore the
West Bank and its famous pharaonic tombs in the Valley of
the Kings, the Karnak temple complex, and the Luxor Temple.
Your itinerary has been carefully crafted to provide you with
an unparalleled experience, combining both regional and
prestigious attractions that showcase Egypt's hidden gems.

This journey is not only designed to provide you with a
remarkable cultural experience but also to promote eco-
friendly tourism. The Felucca is an environmentally
sustainable vessel, and your tour will include opportunities to
learn about sustainable practices and support local
communities that prioritize environmental conservation. This
tour offers a unique and fulfilling way to experience the
beauty and rich culture of Egypt.
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